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A Corporate Legal Group tradition since before the Turn Of The Century, this is our way 
of spreading Joy and Good Tidings to a very select group of very important recipients at 
very little marginal cost.  The reader should keep in mind that care should be taken when 
lifting this greeting (if reproduced in a corporeal form), since its mass, and thus its 
weight, is dependent on its velocity relative to the user. 
 
Please accept, with no obligation, implied or implicit, the best wishes of the Corporate 
Legal Group (sometimes hereinafter referred to as the "wisher" or “us” or “publisher” or 
however else we refer to ourselves in this document in our complete and unfettered 
discretion) for an environmentally conscious, socially responsible, low stress, non-
addictive, gender and gender-identity neutral, celebration of the winter solstice holiday, 
practiced within the most enjoyable traditions of the religious persuasion of your choice, 
or secular practices of your choice, with respect for the religious/secular persuasions 
and/or traditions of others, or their choice not to practice religious or secular traditions at 
all . . . . . and a fiscally successful, personally fulfilling, and medically uncomplicated 
recognition of the onset of the generally accepted calendar year 2013, but not without 
due respect for the calendars of choice of other cultures whose contributions to society  
have helped make America great, (not to imply that America is necessarily greater than 
any other country or is the only "America"  in the western hemisphere or that there are 
not other hemispheres of equal dignity), and without regard to the race, creed,  color, 
age, physical ability, religious faith, or sexual preference or identity of the wishee (or lack 
thereof with regards to any or all of such, or other, factors) (and further not to imply that 
the winter solstice should be considered a holiday for those afflicted, through no fault of 
their own, with some form of psychological or physical depression occasioned by the 
natural reduction of sunlight or increase in precipitation due to seasonal factors (or 
increase/reduction for those in the so-called Southern Hemisphere)). (Note: based on 
some news stories we remain modestly concerned, though less so than in previous 
years (having seen the movie “2012”) about the Mayan calendar since it allegedly 
predicts the End Of Time (EOT) in 2012, although this might be a function of it being 
inappropriately interpreted by non-Mayan so-called “scholars”, but in all events we 
disclaim any responsibility for the EOT and as a matter of public policy we do not 
necessarily support the EOT). 
 
The wishes provided herein represent the sentiment of the sender as of the date written 
and may not reflect the sender's sentiments on the date this is first received or anytime 
thereafter. The sender reserves the right to deny the sender ever wished the recipient 
wishes, whether warm, cold or any temperature whatsoever. 
 
(By accepting this greeting, you are accepting these terms. This greeting is subject to 
clarification or withdrawal. It is freely transferable with no alteration to the original 
greeting. It implies no promise by the wisher to actually implement any of the wishes for 
her/him or others, and is void where prohibited by law, and is revocable at the sole 
discretion of the wisher.  This wish is warranted to perform as expected within the usual 
application of good tidings for a period of one year, or until the issuance of a subsequent 
holiday greeting, whichever comes first, and warranty is limited to replacement of this 
wish or issuance of a new wish at the sole discretion of the wisher. Terms are subject to 
change without notice. By accepting this greeting the recipient acknowledges that s/he is 
represented by counsel or knew of their right to be represented by counsel and decided 
to accept the greeting without such representation. Do not remove this disclaimer under 
penalty of law). 
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IMPORTANT NOTES:  Provided by the Management for Your Protection. These 
directions are for planning purposes only. You may find that construction projects, traffic, 
or other events may cause road conditions to differ from the map results. Please take a 
few minutes to review these Terms and Conditions. Your use of this website constitutes 
your agreement to follow these rules and to be bound by them. Any non-GAAP financial 
measures should be considered in addition to, not as a substitute for or superior to, 
financial measures calculated in accordance with GAAP. The non-GAAP financial 
measures used by the company may be calculated differently from, and therefore may 
not be comparable to, similarly titled measures used by other companies. Any similarity 
to real persons, living or dead, is purely coincidental. Void where prohibited. This 
document contains forward-looking statements that are subject to a number of risks and 
uncertainties; actual results may differ. Some assembly required. List each check 
separately by bank number. Batteries not included. Contents may settle during 
shipment. Use only as directed. No other warranty expressed or implied. Do not use 
while operating motor vehicle or heavy equipment. Postage will be paid by addressee. 
Subject to FCC approval. This is not an offer to sell or to buy securities. Apply only to 
affected area. May be too intense for some viewers. See store manager for further 
details. Do not stamp. Use other side for additional listings. For recreational use only. Do 
not disturb. All models over 18 years of age. If condition persists, consult your physician. 
No user-serviceable parts inside. Freshest if eaten before date on carton. Subject to 
change without notice. Times approximate. Simulated picture. No postage necessary if 
mailed in the United States. Breaking seal constitutes your acceptance of agreement. 
For off-road use only. As seen on TV. One size fits all. Many suitcases look alike. No 
animals were harmed in the filming of this production. Contains a substantial amount of 
non-tobacco ingredients. Colors may, in time, fade. We have sent the forms that seem to 
be right for you. Slippery when wet. For official use only. Not affiliated with the American 
Red Cross. Drop in any mailbox. Edited for television. Keep cool, process promptly. Post 
office will not deliver without postage. List was current at time of printing. Return to 
sender, no forwarding order on file, unable to forward. Not responsible for direct, indirect, 
incidental or consequential damages resulting from any defect, error, or failure to 
perform. At participating locations only. Not the Beatles. We recommend seat belt usage 
and observance of traffic laws at all times. Penalty for private use, $300. See label for 
sequence. Estimated expenses. Expenses vary and include management fee and fees 
for shareholder services. Substantial penalty for early withdrawal. Do not write below this 
line. Falling rock. Lost ticket pays maximum rate. Your canceled check is your receipt. 
Add toner. Place stamp here. Avoid contact with skin. Sanitized for your protection. Be 
sure each item is properly endorsed. Sign here without admitting guilt. Slightly higher 
west of the Mississippi. Employees and their families are not eligible. Beware of wild 
animals. Your mileage may vary. Contestants have been briefed on some questions 
before the show. Limited time offer, call now to ensure prompt delivery. You must be 
present to win. No passes accepted for this engagement. No purchase necessary. 
Processed at location stamped in code at top of carton. Shading within a garment may 
occur. Keep away from fire or flame. Replace with same type. Approved for veterans. 
Stock markets are volatile and can decline significantly in response to adverse issuer, 
political, regulatory, market, or economic developments. Different parts of the market 
can react differently to these developments. Foreign markets can be more volatile than 
the U.S. market due to increased risks of adverse issuer, political, regulatory, market, or 
economic developments and can perform differently from the U.S. market. The value of 
individual security or particular type of security can be more volatile than the market as a 
whole and can perform differently from the value of the market as a whole. Use the right 
tool for the job. Booths for two or more. Check here if tax deductible. Some equipment 
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shown is optional. Price does not include taxes. No Canadian coins. Not recommended 
for children. Prerecorded for this time zone. Reproduction strictly prohibited. No 
solicitors. No alcohol, dogs, or horses. No anchovies unless otherwise specified. 
Restaurant package, not for resale. List at least two alternate dates. First pull up, and 
then pull down. Call toll free before digging. Driver does not carry cash. Some of the 
trademarks mentioned in this product appear for identification purposes only. Record 
additional transactions on back of previous stub. Do not fold, spindle, or mutilate. This 
section intentionally left blank. Objects may appear closer than they actually are. All of 
the views expressed in the research report accurately reflect the research analyst's 
personal views about any and all of the subject securities or issuers; and no part of the 
research analyst's compensation was, is, or will be, directly or indirectly, related to the 
specific recommendations or views expressed by the research analyst in the research 
report. This textbook contains material on evolution. Evolution is theory, not fact, about 
the origin of living things. This material should be approached with an open mind, 
studied carefully, and critically considered.  Not valid toward previous purchase. Offer 
excludes money orders, alcohol, tobacco, stamps and dairy products. This product 
moves when used. Do not use for personal hygiene. Once used rectally, the 
thermometer should not be used orally. The contents of this publication are intended for 
general discussion only, and should not be regarded as legal guidance. The editors, 
reporters, and writers of this publication are not necessarily accounting or legal experts, 
and some subjects may involve environmental complexities beyond their intellectual 
scope; some topics may be "over their heads." We use a proprietary advertising server 
to display ads on our site. In addition, advertisers may elect to use third-party advertising 
companies to serve ads onto our Web site. Click here to see a list of these advertising 
agencies and their privacy policies. In the course of serving these advertisements, the 
third-party advertisers may place or recognize a unique "cookie" on your browser. 
Members, in accumulating mileage or certificates, may not rely upon the continued 
availability of an award or award level, and members may not be able to obtain all 
offered awards or use awards to all destinations or on all flights. The site is intended for 
adults only and is not intended for use by children of any age. This site does not provide 
medical or any other health care advice, diagnosis or treatment. The site and its 
services, including the information above, are for informational purposes only and are 
not a substitute for professional medical advice, examination, diagnosis or treatment. 
Always seek the advice of your physician or other qualified health professional before 
starting or changing any new exercise program or making a lifestyle change or making 
any changes to existing treatment. Do not delay seeking or disregard medical advice 
based on information on this site. Free data provided is delayed 15 minutes unless 
otherwise noted and is believed accurate but is not warranted or guaranteed.  IRS 
Circular 230 disclosure: To ensure compliance with requirements imposed by the IRS, 
we inform you that any tax advice contained in this communication (including any 
attachments) was not intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the 
purpose of (i) avoiding tax-related penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (ii) 
promoting, marketing or recommending to another party any matters addressed herein. 
For each company mentioned in this compendium report, the respective analyst (or 
analysts) who cover the company (companies) certifies that all of the views expressed in 
this research report accurately reflect the analyst's (or analysts') personal views about 
any and all of the subject issuer(s) or securities. The analyst (or analysts) also certifies 
that no part of the analyst's compensation was, is, or will be directly or indirectly related 
to the specific recommendation(s) or view(s) in this report. Notice: This email could be 
considered as an advertisement under federal law. Foreign currency rates of exchange 
may adversely affect the value, price or income of any security or related investment 
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mentioned in this report. In addition, investors in securities such as ADRs, whose values 
are influenced by the currency of the underlying security, effectively assume currency 
risk. Improper use of any power tool may cause serious or fatal injury. Read, understand 
and follow carefully the operating and safety instructions in your instruction manual 
before using this product.  The information contained in this e-mail and any files 
transmitted with it are private and confidential. It is intended for the named addressee 
only. If you are not the intended addressee you are prohibited from storing, copying or 
using the information in any way. If you received this e-mail due to a transmission error 
please notify the sender immediately. No liability is accepted by sender for any losses 
caused by viruses contracted during transit over the Internet or present in any receiving 
system. This e-mail is not intended to create legally binding commitments on behalf of 
sender, nor do its contents reflect the corporate views or policies of sender. The 
information contained in this email message may be privileged, confidential and 
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, any dissemination, 
distribution or copying is strictly prohibited. If you think that you have received this email 
message in error, please notify the sender by reply email and delete the message and 
any attachments. Professional driver on closed course. Please do not attempt this in 
your car; it may void your warranty.  This document is a fictionalized, satirical 
publication. Its content should in no way be interpreted as an actual record of events, 
unless a story specifically states that its contents are an actual recording of events. 
These stories are also not intended to be, nor should they be construed as, attempts to 
predict the future course of any individual or entity, but should be viewed only as parody. 
This document is not associated with any other news service. Names used in this 
document stories, unless those of public figures or entities, are fictional, and any 
resemblance to actual persons or entities is coincidental, unintentional, and accidental. 
Any event described in this document that actually comes to pass should also be 
considered coincidental, unintentional, and accidental. Expiration dates will not be 
extended. Void if sold or bartered.  Any other use of this telecast or of any pictures, 
descriptions, or accounts of the game without the NFL’s consent, is prohibited. Objects 
posing as ‘Consumer Advocates’ are closer to trial lawyers than they appear. At no time 
should you endanger yourself or others, take any unnecessary risks or infringe any laws. 
We advise that you never reveal any personal information about yourself or anyone else 
(for example: telephone number, home address or email address), and please do not 
include postal addresses of any kind. Please note that for the purposes of this document 
the terms “require, coerce, or compel” include physical violence, threat, intimidation, 
retaliation, the conditioning of any private or public benefit or care on consent to 
implantation, or other means that causes a reasonable person of ordinary susceptibilities 
to acquiesce to implementation when he or she otherwise would not.  This site contains 
copyrighted material the use of which has not always been specifically authorized by the 
copyright owner. We are making such material available in our efforts to advance 
understanding of environmental, political, human rights, economic, democracy, scientific, 
and social justice issues, etc. We believe this constitutes a 'fair use' of any such 
copyrighted material as provided for in section 107 of the US Copyright Law. In 
accordance with Title 17 U.S.C. Section 107, the material on this site is distributed 
without profit to those who have expressed a prior interest in receiving the included 
information for research and educational purposes. Do not iron while wearing shirt.  Do 
not put child in bag. Do not put any person in this washer. Because of the generality of 
this update, the information provided herein may not be applicable in all situations and 
should not be acted upon without specific legal advice based on particular situations. 
Although the sender may operate anti-virus programs, it does not accept responsibility 
for any damage whatsoever caused by viruses being passed. The Site’s blog is intended 
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to facilitate open communication and discourse.  However, you shall not submit any 
communication or content that is defamatory, harassing, threatening, obscene, 
pornographic, invasive of privacy, illegal or otherwise encourages illegal activity, would 
violate the rights of others or give rise to liability.  We reserve the right (but assume no 
obligation) to monitor any submissions or postings and delete, move or edit any content 
that we consider inappropriate or unacceptable for any reason.  We reserve the right to 
republish any material contributed by Site visitors.  By posting a message in any public 
area of the Site or submitting any correspondence to us, you expressly grant us a global 
nonexclusive license to publish, reproduce, sell, disclose, distribute or use such material 
for any purpose whatsoever.  You hereby further grant us the global nonexclusive right 
to use any ideas, concepts or techniques embodied in such materials for any purpose 
whatsoever.  In addition, you hereby waive any and all moral rights you may have in any 
such materials.  Further, you hereby authorize us to edit and otherwise modify any such 
material prior to our use, publication, distribution, sale, reproduction or disclosure 
thereof.  You also agree that all such material will be deemed to be provided to us on a 
non-confidential and non-proprietary basis.  Material that is copyright protected may not 
be submitted without permission from the copyright owner, and you are solely 
responsible for the failure to obtain any such permission.  As further explained in our 
privacy policy, we will also comply with any legal requests to disclose any submissions, 
communications or postings to others, including to law enforcement agencies. We will be 
entitled to use, reproduce, disclose, publish and distribute any material you submit for 
any purpose whatsoever, without restriction and without compensating you in any way. 
For this reason, we ask that you not send us any comments that you do not wish to 
assign to us, including any confidential information or any original creative materials 
such as stories, product ideas, computer code or original artwork. If any provision of this 
Agreement is found by a court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid or unenforceable, 
the parties agree that the remaining provisions of the Agreement shall remain in full 
force and effect, provided that the allocation of risks described herein is given effect to 
the fullest extent possible. Our failure to act with respect to a breach by you or others 
does not constitute a waiver of our right to act with respect to subsequent or similar 
breaches. This Agreement, including any notices and disclosures on the Site, constitutes 
the entire agreement between you and us. Do not drive while distracted. Applies only to 
halogenated flame retardants and PVC in components.  Halogens are below 900 PPM 
bromine and 900 PPM chlorine. The original equipment manufacturer must provide TPM 
functionality, which requires a TPM-supported BIOS. TPM functionality must be 
initialized and may not be available in all countries. I hereby agree to participate in the 
above multi-media project ("Project") produced by Producer, and irrevocably grant my 
permission and authorize Producer to record, re-record and photograph my likeness, my 
name, my performance, my voice, interviews of me, and information relating to me, to 
portray or describe me as Producer may elect, and to make use of any incidents of my 
life in any and all editions of the Project, and in advertising, marketing, publicity and 
promotion related to the Project, and to reproduce and publish the same throughout the 
universe in perpetuity, in any and all media now known or hereinafter devised, including 
without limitation, all forms of television, home video, digital download, radio and print. If 
at our request you send certain specific submissions (e.g., postings to chats, surveys, 
message boards, contests, or similar items) or, despite our request that you not send us 
any other creative materials, you send us creative suggestions, ideas, notes, drawings, 
concepts, or other information (collectively the "Submissions\) shall be deemed and shall 
remain our property in perpetuity. By making any Submission, the sender automatically 
grants, or warrants that the owner of such material expressly grants, us the royalty-free, 
perpetual, irrevocable, non-exclusive right and license to use, reproduce, modify, adapt, 
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publish, translate, and distribute such material (in whole or in part) throughout the 
universe and/or to incorporate it in other works in any form, media or technology now 
known or hereafter developed, for the full term of any copyright, trademark or patent that 
may exist in such material for any purpose that we choose, whether internal, public, 
commercial, or otherwise, without any compensation, credit or notice to the sender 
whatsoever. And on behalf of the TSA, when boarding with gels or liquids, remember the 
3-1-1 rule. First, bottles may only be 3 oz. or smaller in size. Second, they must be 
carried in only one 1-quart plastic bag. Finally only 1 plastic bag is allowed per person. 
When you’re going through the X-ray, place the plastic bag in a security bin for easy 
screening. If you need to bring anything else, pack it in your checked luggage. We’d hate 
to see you lose anything when going through security.  If swallowed, contact a poison 
control center immediately. This product is not intended for use as a dental drill or in 
medical applications. This product may break if dropped. Avoid death: before removing 
seat lock park brake and remove key. Do not use vanishing fabric marker to sign checks 
or legal documents. Keep pet birds out of the kitchen when using this product. This 
costume does not enable flight or super strength. Do not iron clothes on body. This 
product moves when used. Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure or 
error-free. Therefore, we do not represent that this information is complete or accurate 
and it should not be relied upon as such. The company is a Swiss Verein with member 
firms around the world. In accordance with the common terminology used in professional 
service organizations, reference to a "partner" means a person who is a partner, or 
equivalent, in such a law firm. Similarly, reference to an "office" means an office of any 
such law firm. This may qualify as "Attorney Advertising" requiring notice in some 
jurisdictions. Prior results do not guarantee a similar outcome. Before you send e-mail to 
us, please be aware that your communications with us through this message will not 
create a lawyer-client relationship with us. Do not send us any information that you or 
anyone else considers to be confidential or secret unless we have first agreed to be your 
lawyers in that matter. Any information you send us before we agree to be your lawyers 
cannot be protected from disclosure. This is an estimated price; this is not your final 
invoice. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender and delete all 
copies. No person shall be denied employment, be excluded from participation in, be 
denied the benefits of, or subject to discrimination in any program or activity, on the 
basis of gender, religion, beliefs, national origin, ethnic group, or disabling condition. You 
may refuse to contribute without reprisal. Unauthorized disclosures of classified 
documents (whether in print, on a blog, or on websites) do not alter the documents' 
classified status or automatically result in declassification of the documents. To the 
contrary, classified information, whether or not already posted on public websites or 
disclosed to the media, remains classified, and must be treated as such by federal 
employees and contractors, until it is declassified by an appropriate U.S. Government 
authority. We will deal promptly with your complaint. If we cannot resolve the complaint 
to your satisfaction within a reasonable time, you or we may refer the complaint to the 
Privacy Commissioner. Any Claim shall be arbitrated or litigated, as the case may be, on 
an individual basis and shall not be consolidated with any Claim of any other party 
whether through class action proceedings, class arbitration proceedings or otherwise. 
Without limiting the foregoing, you agree not to use any device, software or routine to 
interfere or attempt to interfere with the proper working of the Site or any activity being 
conducted on the Site other than through the search engine and search agents available 
from generally available third-party providers; or attempt to decipher, decompile, 
disassemble or reverse-engineer any of the software comprising or in any way making 
up a part of the Site. In the case of a flight cancellation or delay, which has caused you 
to miss your connecting flight, our staff and systems will focus on rebooking as many 
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customers as possible on alternate flights, either direct to the destination or via 
connections through other airports, whichever best accommodates the customer’s 
needs. The occurrence called “kickback” can cause serious or fatal injury. Always read 
the instruction manual carefully before using your saw. The products discussed herein 
may have different product labeling in different countries. Patients should not use the 
information contained herein for diagnosing a health or fitness problem or disease. 
Some features are unavailable while driving. If your eye is scratched, infected or 
irritated, stop using all eye cosmetics and go to an eye doctor immediately. We no longer 
accept international orders. The number of chargebacks, losses, and credit card frauds 
and customs delays has grown to the point that international sales as a whole represent 
a net loss to our company. Cut away from your body, not toward it. Always point the 
muzzle in a safe direction. Use of protective gear can greatly reduce injuries while riding. 
If protective gear is worn, be sure that it does not interfere with steering, braking and 
pedaling. Know your own abilities, and do not ride beyond them.  Remove and destroy 
all plastic wrapping materials. Never use plastic bags as mattress covers. The plastic 
film may cling to a baby's face and cause suffocation. Any screw inserted into a wood 
component that cannot be tightened securely should be replaced by one that fits. On-
screen and printer color representations may vary from actual paint colors. May contain 
peanuts. Do not use while sleeping. Data and images displayed on these pages are not 
official operational products, and are provided only for examples of experimental use by 
remote sensing researchers, or experienced meteorologists or oceanographers. To 
retain this borrower benefit and avoid late fees, you must make and have your payments 
posted to your account no later than the scheduled due date. Any payment posted after 
the due date will result in the termination of such benefit. The most fundamental particles 
in this product are held together by a “gluing” force about which little is currently known 
and whose adhesive power cannot therefore be permanently guaranteed. Unpredictable 
weather can delay fruit harvests up to three weeks or more. Texas state law prohibits 
delivering wine containing more than 16% alcohol. Same Day Service is not available for 
all areas. You understand that each individual’s success will be determined by his or her 
desire, dedication, background, effort and motivation to work. There is no guarantee you 
will duplicate any of the results stated here. You recognize any business endeavor has 
inherent risk for loss of capital. Any event contains an inherent element of risk. In 
registering for this event I acknowledge this and understand that all possible steps will 
be taken to reduce the risk to acceptable levels. I consent to medical treatment being 
administered to my child as appropriate. We accept no responsibility for crash damage. 
It is impossible to determine for certain whether crash damage was the result of a radio 
system failure or pilot error. We accept no responsibility for crash damage occurring 
during the use of a radio-controlled model. We accept no responsibility for improper 
installation of our products. Electrical polarity must be properly observed in hooking up 
electrical components. Fuses must be used with all electrical components where 
indicated (example: speed controllers). Buy pre-assembled packs from an authorized 
dealer, rather than assembling packs from loose cells. You should not use this 
information for diagnosing a health problem or disease but should always consult your 
own physician. May cause eyelid skin darkening which may be reversible, and there is 
potential for increased brown iris pigmentation which is likely to be permanent. If you, 
your family, or caregiver notice agitation, hostility, depression, or changes in behavior, 
thinking, or mood that are not typical for you, or you develop suicidal thoughts or actions, 
anxiety, panic, aggression, anger, mania, abnormal sensations, hallucinations, paranoia, 
or confusion, stop taking the product and call your doctor right away. The events 
depicted in this movie are fictitious. Any similarity to any person living or dead is merely 
coincidental. Moreover, a good faith dispute does not include buyer's remorse (that is, 
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the item delivered was as described in the item description, but you no longer want the 
item regardless of the reason). Testimonials, case studies, and examples found at this 
website are exceptional results, do not reflect the typical purchaser’s experience, don’t 
apply to the average person and are not intended to represent or guarantee that anyone 
will achieve the same or similar results. Please note that the content of this page can 
change without prior notice. You are about to watch a movie, a commercial product 
made for your entertainment and our financial benefit. Believer discretion is advised. We 
periodically review personnel policies in part or as a whole, to ensure that they continue 
to reflect current thinking in the field of Human Resources Management and are 
consistent with trends and legislative requirements. This site is of an adult nature. 
Please do not enter this site if you are under 18 years of age and press the back button 
on your browser to leave now. By entering this site you are verifying that you are over 
the age of 18 and fully understand that this site is of an adult nature. Please understand 
that artisanal cheese molds, simply scrape away any unwanted mold and the cheese 
below is still good to eat, as we only carry natural cheeses.  This item has a longer 
processing time than most. Percent Daily Values are based on a 2,000 calorie diet. If 
you become dissatisfied in any way with this Website or its Terms of Use or Privacy 
Policy, your sole and exclusive remedy is to stop using this Website and its services. 
Wear loose fitting, comfortable clothes and tennis shoes. The pictures used to display 
adventures in promotional material and website, are for illustration purposes only and 
may not accurately reflect the details of an individual experience. Do not send us any 
information that you or anyone else considers to be confidential or secret unless we 
have first agreed to be your lawyers in that matter. Any information you send us before 
we agree to be your lawyers cannot be protected from disclosure. By submitting any 
Unsolicited Information, you are granting us a perpetual, royalty-free and irrevocable 
right and license to use, reproduce, modify, adapt, publish, translate, distribute, transmit, 
publicly display, publicly perform, sublicense, create derivative works from, transfer and 
sell such Unsolicited Information and to use your name and other identifying information 
in connection with such Unsolicited Information. Please keep in mind that Some 
Quantum Physics Theories Suggest That When the Consumer Is Not Directly Observing 
This Product, It May Cease to Exist or Will Exist Only in a Vague and Undetermined 
State. Warning: Pregnant women, the elderly and children under 10 should avoid 
prolonged exposure to Happy Fun Ball. Caution: Happy Fun Ball may suddenly 
accelerate to dangerous speeds. Happy Fun Ball Contains a liquid core, which, if 
exposed due to rupture, should not be touched, inhaled, or looked at. Do not use Happy 
Fun Ball on concrete. Discontinue use of Happy Fun Ball if any of the following occurs: 
Itching Vertigo Dizziness Tingling in extremities Loss of balance or coordination Slurred 
speech Temporary blindness Profuse sweating Heart palpitations. If Happy Fun Ball 
begins to smoke, get away immediately. Seek shelter and cover head. Happy Fun Ball 
may stick to certain types of skin. When not in use, Happy Fun Ball should be returned 
to its special container and kept under refrigeration. Any resemblance to persons living 
or dead should be plainly apparent to them and those who know them, especially if the 
author has been kind enough to have provided their real names and, in some cases, 
their phone numbers. All events described herein actually happened, though on 
occasion the author has taken certain, very small, liberties with chronology, because that 
is his right as an American. Do not use near stairs. Do not use near sharp or pointed 
objects (i.e., rings, bracelets, high heeled shoes, staples, pins, paperclips, pets) or 
source of heat. Although the balls are extremely strong, if the surface of the ball is cut, 
punctured or damaged, its integrity can be lost and the ball can burst instantly. The 
preceding program contained scenes of extreme violence and should not have been 
viewed by young children. Viewers unfamiliar with the accents of the United Kingdom 
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would be well advised to turn on Closed Captioning. Not a low calorie food. Statements 
about the products efficacy have not been evaluated by the Food and Drug 
Administration. The Seller acquires this product from an American & European 
manufacturer as a fully boxed, brand new, never used, not remanufactured product. The 
product is NOT evaluated by the Seller for mechanics or safety in any way whatsoever.  
The Buyer, by purchasing this product fully accepts the terms that the Buyer assumes 
full and total responsibility for any and all aspects regarding: health, property damage, 
pain, eye damage from misuse, liability, burning from misuse, failing to keep product 
away from children, or death... or agrees to NOT bid on, purchase, or to use this 
product.  The Seller has priced this item (very low) in accordance with its unsupervised 
inherent risks of operation along with being unevaluated by the Seller; moreover, all 
possible caveats whether listed here or implied are passed on to the buyer. Reference to 
any specific commercial product, process, or service by trade name, trademark, 
manufacturer, or otherwise does not necessarily constitute or imply its endorsement, 
recommendation, or favoring by the U.S. Government or any agency thereof. The views 
and opinions of document authors do not necessarily state or reflect those of the U.S. 
Government or any agency thereof. Not to be used for home dental work. The user of 
this information assumes all risks for personal injury or property damage. There may be 
other chemicals available than those listed in this guide because of insufficient field data 
from the Northeast. This product is intended to be used only as a travel aid and must not 
be used for any purpose requiring precise measurement of direction, distance, location 
or topography. The consumer should be aware that he or she may be the only entity in 
the universe, and therefore that any perceived defects in product quality are the 
consumer's own fault. Every citizen be advised that despite the possibility that his or her 
acts are all entirely predetermined by the blind mechanical nature of the universe and 
are therefore unavoidable and inescapable, he or she will still incur a legal responsibility 
and liability for any torts, violations, misdemeanors, or felonies he or she commits. 
Because knowledge is defined for the purpose of this product literature as "justified true 
belief", the manufacturer cannot prove that they "know" any of the information provided 
with this product to be true, correct, complete, or consistent because they cannot 
demonstrate their internal belief states through the principle of Philosophic Privacy. Due 
to the possibility that a common notion of ethics are not universally shared by all sentient 
beings, and that therefore the manufacturer may have entirely different concept of 
"fairness", "equity", "honesty", and "integrity" than the consumer, the consumer should 
not expect the product purchased to conform in any way to the advertised properties of 
the product. Rotating shaft can grab, mangle and dismember. Do not operate with guard 
removed. In case of accidental skin injection, seek immediate "Surgical Treatment."  
Failure to follow this warning can result in amputation or serious injury. This product is 
not to be used in bathrooms. Twist top off with hands. Throw top away. Do not put top in 
mouth. Warning! This is not underwear! Do not attempt to put in pants. Fumes may be 
present. WARNING: Do not smoke until hair is dry. All activities monitored by video 
camera.  

ANOTHER NOTE: By popular demand, the new stuff added since last year’s edition 
starts here:  

Not gluten-free. The performance of this contract is subject to termination without liability 
upon the occurrence of any circumstance beyond the control of either party – such as 
acts of God, war, acts of terrorism, government regulations, disaster, strikes (except 
those involving the employees or agents of the party seeking the protection of this 
clause), civil disorder, or curtailment of transportation facilities. Commodities requiring 
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special or additional care or attention in handling or stowing must be so marked and 
packaged as to ensure safe transportation with ordinary care. All candles or any devices 
that emit flame or smoke must be enclosed in glass or non-flammable containers. 
Please arrange to have someone available to care for living and perishable items when 
they arrive. No shorts, cut-offs, sandals or clogs are permitted and all clothing must be 
clean and in good repair. Please demonstrate a positive attitude about our wonderful 
facilities and above all, treat our staff and our guests with the greatest of courtesy. We 
are sending this electronic card in lieu of printed cards as an economically and 
environmentally friendly choice.  We are keeping the savings for ourselves. The United 
Nations Convention on Contracts for the International Sale of Goods and the Vienna 
Convention on the International Sale of Goods shall not apply. This email may constitute 
a commercial electronic mail message under the CAN-SPAM Act of 2003. Carrier will 
use cargo heaters, blankets, and other equipment as may be available at the local 
service centers. We also reserve the right to deny any order with an incorrect price or 
product description. Any corrections we feel need to be made can be made, even after 
an order is acknowledged. Once you know your measurements, you can see what sizes 
they correspond to on our sizing charts, and find the best fit possible. We cannot and do 
not guarantee that the product images available to you on the website are accurate in 
every detail. We do not guarantee the sale of your horse, your horse's services, your 
products or services or any other product or service advertised on our site. We do not 
guarantee the owner/seller's services, representations, or any horse's performance or 
fitness for a particular purpose. In addition, we strongly recommend that a pre-purchase 
exam should be performed by the buyer's equine veterinarian of choice, on any horse 
prior to purchase. Hawaii Restriction Notice: Shipment of living materials (viruses, algae, 
bacteria, plants, protozoa, insects, and other animals) into Hawaii is restricted. Please 
contact the Hawaii Department of Agriculture (808.832.0566) before ordering this 
material, and if necessary, provide us with import permits and other pertinent 
information. No Peanuts, Gluten, Eggs and Milk, Dairy, Soy, Tree Nuts, Shellfish, and no 
Corn. Some of the most common side effects are dizziness, blurry vision, weight gain, 
sleepiness, trouble concentrating, swelling of your hands and feet, dry mouth, and 
feeling "high." Call your doctor right away if you have new or worsening depression, 
suicidal thoughts or actions, or unusual changes in mood or behavior. If you have 
suicidal thoughts or actions, do not stop without first talking to your doctor. These 
statements have not been evaluated by the Food and Drug Administration. This product 
is not intended to diagnose, treat, cure or prevent any disease. You are responsible for 
ensuring that your use of or participation in the activities of this site does not affect your 
eligibility as an amateur athlete. Please check with your amateur athletic association for 
the rules that apply to you. We have developed a comprehensive program to ensure that 
human rights and workers’ rights are respected throughout our supply chain and to 
encourage and support community development in the regions where we source our raw 
materials. We believe that industry and communities can work together to find a balance 
that will lead to more sustainable practices in the future. The occurrence called 
“kickback” can cause serious or fatal injury.  Approaching or contacting electric power 
lines with these tools may cause serious injury or death from electrocution. Electricity 
can jump from one point to another by means of arcing and/or may be conducted 
through damp branches. Maintain a clearance of at least 50 feet (15 M) between the 
tools and any electrical line carrying a live current. To reduce the risk of injury from 
falling objects, do not cut vertically above your head. Always wear appropriate protective 
apparel as outlined in the instruction manual. Keep bystanders away. Climbing is a 
serious sport that necessarily involves the acquisition of knowledge, development of 
skills, taking risks, and the exercise of good judgment developed over time. Activities 
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that do not actively engage and involve the person in recreation, learning, growth, 
challenge, development, and competency do not have the essential characteristics of a 
sport, and certainly not the sport of climbing. If you have a sudden decrease or loss of 
vision or hearing, call a healthcare provider right away. Lashes enhanced in post 
production. Not only is it permissible for NCAA coaches to give to collegiate players, but 
its individual and convenient packaging allows for worry-free distribution in the locker 
room.  In order to mutually protect our relationships of integrity, honesty, and fairness 
with all of our vendors and business partners, we prohibit our associates from accepting 
cash, merchandise, services or any gift of more than nominal value. This exception does 
not apply to a student-athlete who attends a Division III institution for graduate school, 
unless the student-athlete is attending the same institution at which he or she was an 
undergraduate. A stock is defined as volatile if the stock price has moved up or down by 
20% or more in a month in at least 8 of the past 24 months or the analyst expects 
significant volatility going forward. This offer is extended to you under the condition that 
your acceptance does not violate any applicable rules or policies within your 
organization. If you are unsure whether your acceptance may violate and such rules or 
policies, we strongly encourage you to seek advice from your ethics or compliance 
official. If you are unable to accept all or a portion of the complimentary invitation and 
would like to pay for your own expenses, we are happy to provide a reasonable market 
value and an invoice or other suitable payment process. Please find out whether the 
participation is taxable under your local tax laws. If you have any questions, please 
contact your employer's HR department or your tax adviser. Passengers with physical 
limitations may travel with a properly trained and certified assistance animal (for example 
trained seeing-eye dogs) provided the Carrier is given advance written notice of 
Passenger’s desire to travel with the animal and Passenger assumes full responsibility 
for the animal’s food and hygiene. The Passenger hereby agrees and consents to a 
reasonable search being made of the Passenger’s person, baggage or other property, 
and stateroom, and to the removal and confiscation or destruction of any object which 
may, in the opinion of the Carrier, impair the safety of the Vessel or comfort or 
convenience of other Passengers. The Passenger grants Carrier the exclusive right 
throughout the universe in perpetuity, free of any claims, to use his/her photograph, 
image, likeness, voice, or other audio or visual portrayal taken during the cruise, 
including the right to edit, combine and make unrestricted use of such materials with 
other materials, or to delete or juxtapose any part of such materials with other materials, 
in any fashion, including without limitation the unrestricted right to copy, revise, 
distribute, display and sell photographs, images, film, tapes or recordings in any and all 
media now known or hereafter devised, including without limitation use on the Internet, 
for all purposes, including for promotional, advertising, marketing or other business 
purposes of the Carrier or affiliated or related companies or brands. Passenger hereby 
relinquishes any property interest or right Passenger may have in any such materials. 
Because we receive monetary or securities compensation, most often in the form of 
common stock (hereafter referred to as the "Shares") for our dissemination of publicly 
disseminated information (the “Information”) regarding various issuers of securities, we 
disclose our specific compensation herein and in our individual reports of profiled 
issuers. It is imperative that all readers carefully review our Disclaimer in its entirety, 
which contains important information about penny stocks, our operations, the limited 
nature of the Information and various risks attendant to the companies that we profile, 
including that: (a ) we receive our compensation in free trading shares, which we will sell 
immediately upon their receipt as well as during the dissemination of such Information or 
within hours, days, weeks or months thereafter, or at any time; as a result, our selling 
activities will cause significant volatility in the Issuer’s stock price and/or significantly 
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depress the Issuer’s stock price; (b) we will buy and sell the Shares in the open market 
before, during or after the dissemination of the Information or at any time, which will 
cause significant volatility in the Issuer’s stock price and/or significantly depress or 
increase the Issuer’s stock price; (c) there is an inherent and actual conflict of interest 
that exists between our Readers’ interests and our interests because we: (i) receive the 
Shares as compensation for disseminating the Information and thereafter sell those 
Shares at any time for monetary gain, including at the same time the Information is being 
disseminated or shortly thereafter or at any time; and (ii) buy and sells the Profiled 
Company’s shares in the open market at the same time or before the Information is 
being disseminated or shortly after the dissemination of the Information or at any time. 
Our gains from sale of the shares may be substantial. Campaigns may not accept 
contributions from foreign nationals. Please do not send cash. Not printed at 
Government Expense. Despite the large significance of the measurement reported here 
and the stability of the analysis, the potentially great impact of the result motivates the 
continuation of our studies in order to investigate possible still unknown systematic 
effects that could explain the observed anomaly. We deliberately do not attempt any 
theoretical or phenomenological interpretation of the results. This is printed on uncoated 
paper manufactured entirely with certified non-polluting wind-generated renewable 
energy, processed chlorine-free and certified Ancient Forest Friendly. We have aligned 
the requirements for doing business with us with the Universal Declaration of Human 
Rights, International Labor Organization's ("ILO") Core Conventions and the United 
Nations Framework on Business and Human Rights. Our associates also participate 
(both as speakers and attendees) in external training programs and seminars on social 
compliance issues, including on the issues of human trafficking and slavery. This 
product information is intended for US consumers only. If you experience chest pain, 
nausea, or any other discomforts during sex, seek immediate medical help. None of the 
contributors, sponsors, administrators, or anyone else connected with the publication in 
any way whatsoever can be responsible for the appearance of any inaccurate or libelous 
information or for your use of the information contained in or linked from these pages. 
The Firm may engage in securities transactions in a manner inconsistent with the 
Product and, with respect to securities covered by the Product, will buy or sell from 
customers on a principal basis. If any of these risk factors has a greater downside 
impact than we anticipate, the share price will likely have difficulty attaining our target 
price. Conversely, if the impact of any of these upside risks is greater than we anticipate, 
the stock could exceed our target price. If the reader of this message is not the intended 
recipient, or the employee or agent responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, you 
are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication 
is strictly prohibited. Questions?  Comments?  We’re checking mail around the clock and 
we REFUSE to let uncertainty come between us and your wallet and/or purse! We do 
not sell screensavers, because it is not 1998. We do not accept or consider unsolicited 
ideas, including ideas for new advertising campaigns, new promotions, new or improved 
products or technologies, product enhancements, processes, materials, marketing plans 
or new product names. Please do not submit any unsolicited ideas, original creative 
artwork, suggestions or other works (“submissions”) in any form to us. We reserve the 
right to refuse, limit, or cancel any service and/or membership for any reasonable cause, 
including without limitation if, in our the opinion, a member is using services in 
conjunction with offensive, illegal, or otherwise inappropriate content or material; 
displays unreasonable, abusive, or disruptive behavior; requires unusual or extensive 
services/training beyond the scope of these Terms and Conditions or our typical service 
offerings; or has otherwise breached these Terms and Conditions. Always make certain 
your firearm is unloaded before crossing a fence, climbing a tree, jumping a ditch or 
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negotiating other obstacles. In the event of unauthorized use of your credit card, you 
must notify your credit card provider in accordance with its reporting rules and 
procedures. A California law, the Transparency in Supply Chains Act of 2010, requires 
certain disclosures regarding human trafficking and slavery, in particular. As described 
above, we select suppliers who support our values and expect them to comply with all 
applicable laws and regulations. We do not currently verify our product supply chain or 
audit suppliers specifically to evaluate risks of human trafficking and slavery or require 
our direct suppliers to certify that materials incorporated into products comply with laws 
regarding slavery and human trafficking in the countries in which they are doing 
business. We also do not currently maintain internal standards for employees and 
contractors regarding slavery and human trafficking specifically or provide training to 
employees and management on these specific matters. Employees are expected to 
respect the human rights and dignity of all people. We neither publish nor accept letters 
from readers. It is our policy that the readers should have no voice whatsoever and that 
this shall be solely a one-way conduit of information. The editorial page is reserved for 
the exclusive use of the staff to advance whatever opinion or agenda it sees fit, or, in 
certain cases, for paid advertorials by the business community. It is the stated position of 
the United States Air Force that their safeguards would prevent the occurrence of such 
events as are depicted herein. Warning: Pregnant women, the elderly and children under 
10 should avoid prolonged exposure to Happy Fun Ball. Caution: Happy Fun Ball may 
suddenly accelerate to dangerous speeds. Happy Fun Ball Contains a liquid core, which, 
if exposed due to rupture, should not be touched, inhaled, or looked at. Do not use 
Happy Fun Ball on concrete. Any translation of these documents into languages other 
than English is intended solely as a convenience to the non-English-reading public. We 
have attempted to provide an accurate translation of the text, but the official text is the 
English text and any differences in the translation are not binding and have no legal 
effect. References identifying the original document in English are available in most non-
English documents. Permission to use or reproduce official insignia of the Department is 
granted on a case-by-case basis and involves the consideration of many relevant 
factors, including: the cost or benefit to the Department or the government of granting 
the request; the unintended appearance of endorsement or authentication by the 
Department; the potential for misuse; the effect on Department security; the reputability 
of the use; and the extent of control by the Department over the ultimate use and 
distribution of any product(s) or publication(s) bearing official insignia of the Department. 
For site security purposes and to ensure that this service remains available to all users, 
we employ software programs to monitor traffic to identify unauthorized attempts to 
upload or change information, or otherwise cause damage. In the event of authorized 
law enforcement investigations, and pursuant to any required legal process, information 
from these sources may be used to help identify an individual. Due to the nature of the 
products we provide, we cannot be responsible for irregularities in size, shape, and color 
of our products. Many of our products can change color naturally with time due to the 
normal aging process. Furthermore, because we use various quarries and other sources 
for our products, there may be changes in size, shape, and color between loads. This 
means that you may see variations over time in our stock. The Department prohibits 
discrimination in all its programs and activities on the basis of race, color, national origin, 
sex, religion, age, disability, sexual orientation, marital status, family status, status as a 
parent (in education and training programs and activities), because all or part of an 
individual’s income is derived from any public assistance program, or retaliation. (Not all 
prohibited bases apply to all programs or activities.) Not valid on prior purchases. Valid 
Sunday to Thursday. Valid every evening after 6pm. Drivers should have a clear view of 
the road. Do not program or change settings in the GPS unit while driving. Any Twitter, 
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Facebook or LinkedIn message from us is an impersonation by persons unknown. Due 
to the filming method used, guests viewing this film may experience side effects 
associated with motion sickness similar to riding a rollercoaster. 
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